

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
P. O. BOX 2449  
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Safety Eyewear  
FOR: (June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020)  
TIME & DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 21, 2019

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	PRICE	TOTAL	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Dr., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78233	Airgas USA LLC 335 North WW White San Antonio, TX 78219	Cintas Corporation 7007 Fairgrounds, Ste 121 San Antonio, TX 78238	HD Supply 10500 Broadway St San Antonio, TX 78217	Alamo Distribution dba AIW 943 A1&T Center Pkwy San Antonio, TX 78219	Industrial Supply Solutions 17352 Bell North Dr Schertz, TX 78154	BVI Resources 440 Benmar Dr, Ste 1000 Houston, TX 77060	Fastenal 2001 Theurer Blvd Winona, MN 55987	Fisher Scientific 4500 Turnberry Dr Hanover Park, IL 60133	Wesco Distribution 4410 Dividend San Antonio, TX 78219	Medical Wholesale, Inc.	Saf-T-Glove, Inc.	Sunbelt Mill Supply
1.	2,000 ea. (Lawson #34010) Glasses Safety Nemesis Clear, Mfg. Jackson Nemesis Clear Part No. 3013536	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.03 6,060.00	3.58 7,160.00	3.60 7,200.00	3.89 7,780.00	4.18 8,360.00	4.39 8,780.00	3.98 7,960.00	4.89 9,780.00	3.95 7,900.00	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
2.	3,750 ea. (Lawson #34011) Glasses Safety Nemesis Smoke, Mfg. Jackson Nemesis Smoked Part No. 3013538	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.03 11,362.50	3.65 13,687.50	3.87 14,512.50	4.01 15,037.50	4.26 15,975.00	4.47 16,762.50	4.15 15,562.50	4.89 18,337.50	3.95 14,812.50						
3.	200 ea. (Lawson #34008) Glasses Safety Uvex Grey OTG, Mfg. Uvex ultraspec 2001 Grey Part No. UVS-0113	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.86 572.00	4.15 830.00	4.63 926.00	4.46 892.00	4.58 916.00	5.47 1,094.00	4.84 968.00	6.50 1,300.00	4.25 850.00						
4.	200 ea. (Lawson #34009) Glasses Safety Uvex Clear OTG, Mfg. Uvex Ultraspec 2001 Clear Part No. UVS-0112	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.63 526.00	3.59 718.00	3.97 794.00	3.85 770.00	3.95 790.00	4.73 946.00	4.20 840.00	5.87 1,174.00	3.65 730.00						
5.	200 ea. (Lawson #34007) Glasses Safety Indoor/Outdoor, Mfg. Pyramex Part No. OTSPYS3580SJ	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.86 572.00	2.32 464.00	2.85 570.00	2.38 476.00	2.56 512.00	2.66 532.00	3.98 796.00	2.25 450.00	28.50 5,700.00						
6.	500 ea. (Lawson #12939) Glasses Safety Visitor Clear Lens, 12ER/6X, Mfg. Crew, Part No. CK110	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1.22 610.00	1.02 510.00	1.12 560.00	1.16 580.00	1.18 590.00	1.17 585.00	1.38 690.00	2.50 1,250.00	1.12 560.00						
7.	600 ea. (Lawson #12924) Glasses Rainbow Mirror Coated, 12ER/8X, Mfg. Crew, Part No. CK118	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1.22 732.00	1.69 1,014.00	2.11 1,266.00	1.93 1,158.00	1.86 1,116.00	1.93 1,158.00	1.94 1,164.00	2.50 1,500.00	1.86 1,116.00						
8.	50 ea. (Lawson #34044) Goggles Safety Indirect Vent Mfg. Crew, Part No. 2235R	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1.75 87.50	2.14 107.00	3.51 175.50	2.45 122.50	2.36 118.00	2.45 122.50	2.98 149.00	10.00 500.00	2.37 118.50						
9.	75,000 ea. (Lawson #15573) Handy pocket size anti-static, anti-fog towelettes for cleaning lens of safety eyewear	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	0.05 3,750.00	0.043 3,225.00	0.046 3,450.00	0.043 3,225.00	0.06 4,500.00	0.05 3,750.00	0.13 9,750.00	8.00 600,000.00	152.00 11,400,000.00						
	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	<b>24,272.00</b>	27,715.50	29,454.00	30,041.00	32,877.00	33,730.00	37,879.50	634,291.50	11,431,787.00						
	<b>EXTENSION 1</b>		<b>24,272.00</b>														
	<b>EXTENSION 2</b>		<b>24,272.00</b>														
	<b>EXTENSION 3</b>		<b>24,272.00</b>														
	Terms		2 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	1% 10 days	Net 30 days							
	Delivery Days		1-2 days	3-5 days	3 days	7 days	2-5 days	7 days	10 days	1 days							

\*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Abatix Corporation  
Airgas  
Alamo Iron Works  
BVI Resources  
Cintas  
Fastenal  
Fire Storm Depot  
Fisher Scientific

MSC Industrial Supply  
Orr Safety  
Royall Matthiessen  
Safety Supply, Inc.  
Saf-T-Glove, Inc.  
Wesco Distribution  
WW Grainger

Demandstar  
SAWS Website

"No bid sheet" submitted:  
Medical Wholesale, Inc  
Saf-T-Glove, Inc.  
Sunbelt Mill Supply